
Agency
ITEM  CMC ITEM #

 PRICE 

EACH 
QUANTITY  Total Cost 

ACSO
PETZL R/HAND 

ASCENDER
#345023 $71.78 6 $430.68 

ACSO
ROCKNRESC

UE

ACSO #RHP1

ACSO
#202122 

SMALL
6 (2-SMALL)

ACSO

#202124 

MEDIUM

   (2-

MEDIUM)

ACSO
#202125 

LARGE
   (2-LARGE)

ACSO
HURLEY PICKET 

ANCHOR SYSTEM
#303500  $       877.80 

1
 $       877.80 

ACSO

Notch Big Shot Throw 

Line Launcher Deluxe 

Kit #SET1025 No Bid
1

No Bid

 ACSO Bid 

Total : 4,725.78$    

$913.08 

$2,504.22 
ATOM RESCUE 

HARNESS
$417.37 

CONTERRA HITCH 

ANCHOR PLATE
$228.27 4



 



Agency
ITEM  Item #

 PRICE 

EACH 
QUANTITY  Total Cost 

AFD

Dewalt 60v 

reciprocating 

saw w/ charger 

and 2 batteries

DCS388T2 $462.00 

1

$462.00 

AFD

Dewalt 60v 16 

inch chainsaw w/ 

battery

DCCS670X1 $418.00 

1
$418.00 

AFD
Yates Spec Pak 721903 $1,650.00 1  $     1,650.00 

AFD

Paratech air 

cushion (14 ton) 

kit. (low.high lift 

bags)

$7,931.39 1 $7,931.39 

AFD

100 ft, 7/16, 

6X19 EIPS wire 

rope

1.20 ft  No bid 

2
No bid

AFD

3/4 inch eye/eye 

12' T/U 

turnbuckle

1031476 No bid

4
No bid

AFD

1 inch eye/eye 

12' T/U 

turnbuckle

1301573 No bid

2
No bid

AFD

Crosby wire rope 

clips (heavy 

duty) for 7/16 

rope

1037693 No bid 18 No bid

AFD

1/2 inch x 250 

lbs. torque 

wrench

426F08  No bid 1  No bid 

AFD
Crosby Thimbles 

(heavy duty for 

7/16 rope)

1037693 No bid 18 No bid

AFD
7/8 inch G-209 

screw pin 

shackles

1018516 No bid 2 No bid

AFD

1 inch  G-209 

screw pin 

shackles

1018534 No bid 2 No bid

AFD
Custom 

Paratech Raker 

Rail 6

22-796258C  $       576.90 

4
 $     2,307.60 

AFD Rake rail splice 22-796469  $       297.73 2  $        595.46 

AFD Rake raillatch 22-796250  $       190.40 8  $     1,523.20 

AFD
Raker junction 

base
22-796290  $       447.70 2  $        895.40 

AFD Rail Junction 22-796280  $       499.93 2  $        999.86 

1  $     3,327.33 AFD
TU-32 griphoist 

w/ 30ft. 5/8" wire 

rope

6XXGO $3,327.33 



AFD
Raker Angle 

Base
22-796475  $       128.80 4  $        515.20 

AFD
Longshore Strut 

610
22-796360  $    1,572.67 4  $     6,290.68 

AFD
Longshore 

extension 635
22-796376  $       822.27 2 $1,644.54 

AFD
Longshore 

extension 435
22-796356  $       652.40 4 $2,609.60 

AFD
Gold extension, 

model 235
22-796342  $       493.00 4 $1,972.00 

AFD
Longshore 

adjustable brace 

B23

22-796348  $       676.67 4  $     2,706.68 

AFD
Longshore 

adjustable brace 

B57

22-796350  $       828.80 4  $     3,315.20 

AFD
Nailing pad with 

clamp
22-796310C  $       428.40 6  $     2,570.40 

AFD
Double head 

steel picket
22-796P14  $         35.47 4  $        141.88 

AFD Clamp and clevis 22-796330  $       494.67 16  $     7,914.72 

AFD
Extension 

converter 3 in / 

7.6 cm

22-796035  $       218.00 2  $        436.00 

AFD
HFS lonshore 

screw adapter
22-790019  $       254.80 2  $        509.60 

AFD
Bipod conversion 

kit
22-796810  $    5,204.27 1  $     5,204.27 

AFD
Rail 4 latch 

holder
22-796656  $       148.40 2  $        296.80 

AFD Total Bid: $56,237.81





ITEM  Item # PRICE EACH QUANTITY  TOTAL PRICE 

22-796430

Custom PARATECH

Paratech Hammers

22-796006

Custom PARATECH

Lockstroke Strut 19-25

Colonie 22-796000

Custom PARATECH

Lockstroke Strut 25-36

22-796000  $         703.73 

4

 $        2,814.92 

22-796017

Custom PARATECH

Strut Extension 6

Colonie
Strut Extension 12 22-796012  $         182.93 2  $           365.86 

Colonie
Strut Extension 36 22-796036  $         286.53 2  $           573.06 

Colonie
6in SWIVEL BASE 22-796060  $         325.00 8  $        2,600.00 

22-887020K

Custom PARATECH

D/k Cushion 13 Ton (11.9mt)

22-887015K

Custom PARATECH

C/k Cushion 7.4 Ton (6.7mt)

22-887350

Custom PARATECH

Inline Rel 14.5psi (1 Bar) Red

22-887350

Custom PARATECH

Inline Rel 14.5psi (1 Bar) Red

Colonie Maxiforce Air Lifting Bag KPI-1 6in 

x 6in x 3/4in 22-888110G2 332.80$         1 332.80$            

Colonie Maxiforce Air Lifting Bag KPI-3 6in 

x 12in x 3/4in 22-888120G2 440.80$         1 440.80$            

Colonie Maxiforce Air Lifting Bag KPI-5 

10in x 10in x 3/4in 22-888130G2 592.80$         1 592.80$            

Colonie

Kpi-12 Lift Bag 15 X 15 Gen2 22-888140G2 772.80$         1 772.80$            

Colonie Maxiforce Air Lifting Bag KPI-22 

20in x 20in x 7/8 in 22-888160G2 1,031.20$      1 1,031.20$         

Colonie

Kpi-17 Lift Bag 15 X 21 G2 22-888150G2 882.40$         1 822.40$            

Colonie Maxiforce Air Lifting Bag KPI-32 

24in x 24in x7/8 22-888170G2 1,154.40$      1 1,154.40$         

22-888190G2

Custom PARATECH

2  $        5,070.40 

2  $           989.34 

Colonie

22-796430  $         117.60 5  $           588.00 

Colonie

22-796006  $         671.07 4  $        2,684.28 

Colonie

22-796017  $         168.93 2  $           337.86 

Colonie

22-887020K  $      3,604.00 2  $        7,208.00 

Colonie

Colonie

Colonie

22-887015K  $      2,535.20 

22-887350  $         494.67 

22-887352 494.67$         2 989.34$            

Colonie

22-888190G2 1,831.20$      1 1,831.20$         



Kpi-44 Alb 28x28 (711x711mm)

Colonie Dual Deadman Air Lifting Bag 

Controller G3 22-890900G3-150 742.00$         2 1,484.00$         

Colonie

REGULATOR G2 200 PSI CGA 22-895401G2 644.00$         1 644.00$            

Colonie

INLINE RELIEF VALVE 165 PSI 22-890490-150 171.73$         2 343.46$            

22-890730

Custom PARATECH

Double Male Nipple

Colonie

PAKHAMMER 90 KIT 22-550505 5,331.00$      1 5,331.00$         

22-550595

Custom PARATECH

Ph Bit-20“ Spade, 3” Wide

Colonie

Husqvarna K970 K970 No bid 1 No bid

Colonie Little Giant 1200 lb wagon truck, 

perforated deck, 24x36" LDW2436-6X-10P No bid 1 No bid

Colonie Milwaukee M18 FUEL, 18 Volt 

lithium framing nailer No bid 2 No bid

Colonie Milwaukee M18 high output 

12.0Ah batteries No bid 2 No bid

Colonie Milwaukee M18 6 port battery 

charger No bid 1 No bid

Colonie Milwaukee M18 FUEL 18 volt 

lithium ion cordless 7 1/4 inch 

circular saw
No bid 1 No bid

Colonie Bid 

Total: 39,240.85$       

Colonie

22-888190G2 1,831.20$      1 1,831.20$         

Colonie

22-890730 17.73$           2 35.46$              

Colonie

22-550595 203.47$         1 203.47$            



Agency ITEM   PRICE EACH QUANTITY  Total Cost 

Troy FD
Custom Paratech Raker 

Rail 6
22-796258C  $          579.60 4  $   2,318.40 

Troy FD
Rake rail splice 22-796469  $          297.73 

2
 $      595.46 

Troy FD
Rake raillatch 22-796250  $          190.40 8  $   1,523.20 

Troy FD
Raker junction base 22-796290  $          447.07 2  $      894.14 

Troy FD
Rail Junction 22-796280  $          499.33 2  $      998.66 

Troy FD
Raker Angle Base 22-796475  $          128.80 4  $      515.20 

Troy FD
Longshore Strut 610 22-796360  $       1,572.67 4  $   6,290.68 

Troy FD
Longshore extension 

635
22-796376  $          822.27 2  $   1,644.54 

Troy FD
Longshore extension 

435
22-796356  $          652.40 4  $   2,609.60 

Troy FD
Gold extension, model 

235
22-796342  $          460.13 4  $   1,840.52 

Troy FD
Longshore adjustable 

brace B23
22-796348  $          676.67 4  $   2,706.68 

Troy FD
Longshore adjustable 

brace B57
22-796350  $          828.80 4  $   3,315.20 

Troy FD Nailing pad with clamp 22-796310C  $          428.40 6  $   2,570.40 

Troy FD
Hinged base 12 w/ 

anchor ring
22-796180C  $          534.80 4  $   2,139.20 

Troy FD
Double head steel 

picket
22-796P14  $            35.47 4  $      141.88 

Troy FD
Clamp and clevis 22-796330  $          494.67 16  $   7,914.72 

Troy FD hydraFusion strut 10 kit 22-79HA10K  $       3,647.00 2  $   7,294.00 

Troy FD
Extension converter 3 in 

/ 7.6 cm
22-796035  $          218.00 2  $      436.00 

Troy FD
HFS lonshore screw 

adapter
22-790019  $          254.80 2  $      509.60 

Troy FD
Bipod conversion kit 22-796810  $       5,204.27 1  $   5,204.27 

Troy FD
Rail 4 latch holder 22-796656  $          148.40 2  $      296.80 

Troy FD
Ratchet bekt 27 " WII 

3300 lbs
22-890553  $          126.00 

3
 $      378.00 

Troy FD 22796C1H 2  $      765.34 
Custom Paratech Grade 

100 chain 20ft (6.09m)
 $          382.67 



Troy FD Tiedown key w/ J Hook 22-796161  $            43.87 
2

 $        87.74 

Troy FD
TU-32 griphoist w/ 30ft. 

5/8" wire rope
6XXGO $3,327.33 1 $3,327.33 

Troy FD Bid 

Total:
 $ 56,317.56 

Total Bid 

for all 

agencies: 156,522$     


