
RFB-2024-066 HVAC Preventative Maintenance and Emergency Service

Bid Tabulation

Bidder  BPI Piping 
 Eckert 

Mechanical 
 ESCO  JW Danforth 

 Johnson 

Controls 

 Postler & 

Jaeckle 

Location

3 Office Building Chillers NO BID 16,850.00$   NO BID NO BID 13,569.00$        NO BID

Standard Rate 106.00$        204.00$              

OT Rate 145.00$        239.00$              

13 Judicial Building Chillers NO BID 23,375.00$   NO BID NO BID 23,241.00$        NO BID

Standard Rate 106.00$        143.75$        204.00$              

OT Rate 145.00$        180.50$        239.00$              

Repair Material Markup 

Over Contractors Cost % 20.00% 21.00% 25.00% 20.00% 30.00% 20.00%

Annual Total 36,810.00$        

Term Total 110,430.00$      

Contingency Allowance 150,000.00$      

Contract Total 260,430.00$      


