SECTION A

Mfg Item #

PANTS

1 V47681 VERTEX BLACK CARGO PANT Fechheimer #VR47680
2 47280 FECHHEIMER PANTBLK 75/25 POLY/WOOL - men's Fechheimer#47280

3 Flying Cross women's Serge weave wool blend trousers Flying Cross # 47280W
4 1062 TRU-SPEC 24-7 TACTICAL PANT (COMMUNICATIONS) Tru Spec 1062

5 1096 TRU-SPEC 24-7 TACTICAL PANT (WOMAN) Tru-Spec 1096

6 74369 5.11 STRYKE PANT - mens 5.11 74369

7 WOMENS STRYKE PANT TR980 BLK 5.11 64386

8 TACTICAL TACLITE PRO PANT TR506 BLK 5.11 Tactical 74273

9 Executive Chef Pant Uncommon Threads #4020
10 Styke TDU Pant 5.11 #74433

11 CONDOR TACTICAL PANT Condor#38686

12 APEX TACTICAL PANT 5.11 74434

13 Blauer men's 4 pocket wool blend trouser Blauer # 8560T

14 Blauer women's 4 pocket wool blend trouser Blauer # 8560WT

15 Blauer men's 6 pocket wool blend trouser Blauer #8567T

16 Blauer women's 6 pocket wool blend trouser Blauer # 8567W

17 Blauer men's FlexRS Covert Tactical Pant Blauer # 8666

18 Blauer women's FlexRS Covert Tactical Pant Blauer # 8666W

19 5.11 Tactical men's ripstop TDU pant 5.11 # 74003

20 5.11 Tactical women's ripstop TDU pant 5.11 # 64359

21 5.11 Tactical men's Cargo PDU pants 5.11 74326

22 5.11 Tactical women's PDU pants 5.11 64306

23 5.11 men's class B Stryke PDU pant 5.11 # 74427

24 5.11 women's class B Stryke PDU pant 5.11 # 64402

25 5.11 Taclite Pro 11" Ripstop short 5.11 # 73308

SHIRTS

26

BLK/55R8410 FECH S/S/ SHIRT - men's Flying Cross #55R84

Fechheimer #55R8410

27

BLAUR STREET GEAR BLK L/S

Blauer #8705

28

BLAUER STREET GEAR BLK S/S

Blauer #8715

29

FECH L/S BLK POLY/WOOL - men's Flying Cross # 05W84

Fechheimer #05W84

30 5.11 TACTICAL SNAG FREE POLO S/S(COMMUNICATIONS) 5.11 #71049

31 5.11 TACTICAL SNAG FREE POLO (WOMANS) 5.11 #61165

32 4406 TRU-SPEC L/S POLO Tru Spec #1227556
33 BLK-BLAUER MOCK DICKIE Blauer 8119

34 BLK BLAUER L/S MOCK DICKIE Blauer#8110

35 BLK/8460 BK BLAUER CLASS ACT POLY/WOOL S/S/ SHIRT Blauer 8460

36 5.11 TACTICAL UTILI T-SHIRTS 5.11 #40016

37 STREET GEAR POLY/RAY L/S Blauer #890011

38

Men's Cook Shirt

Red Kap#5020BK

39

BLK TACTICAL MENS PATROL PDU S/S/ CLASS A

5.11 #71183 BLK

40

BLK TACTICAL MENS PATROL PDU L/S CLASS A

5.11 #72344 BLK

41 BLK TACTICAL WOMENS PATROL PDU L/S 5.11 #62064
42 Tactical women's Patrol PDU S/S 5.11 #61158
43 BLK TACTICAL TACLITE TDU 5.11 #72054
44 BLK Women's Tactical Taclite L/S TDU 5.11 # 62016
45 TACTICAL BIKE PATROL POLO YLBK 5.11 #71322
46 WOMENS L/S POLY/WOOL BLK - Flying Cross #105W84 Fech #105W8410




47 WOMENS S/S POLY/WOOL BLK - Flying Cross # 155R84 Fech #155R8426

48 Vertx Women's L/S polo Vertex # VTX4030P

49 Vertx Women's S/S Polo Vertx #VTX4010P

50 Vertex mens's S/S Polo Vertx # VTX4000P

51 Vertex Men's L/S Polo Vertx #VTX4020P

52 Flex RS Womens' S/S Base Shirt Blauer #8362W

53 Flex RS Womens L/S Base Shirt Blauer #8361W

54 Flex RS Mens's S/S Supershirt Blauer #8676

55 Flex RS men's L/S Supershirt Blauer #8671

56 Flex RS Womens S/S Supershirt Blauer #8676 W

57 Flex RS Women's L/S Supershirt Blauer #8671W

58 Men's Poly Wool L/S Supershirt Blauer #8436

59 Men's Poly Wool S/S Supershirt Blauer #8446

60 Womens's S/S Supershirt Blauer #8446W

61 Womens's L/S Supershirt Blauer #8436W

62 S/S Bike Patrol Polo LAWPRO #

63 Tactical Womens' S/S Class B Stryke PDU Shirt 5.11 61018

64 Tactical Womens L/S Class B Stryke PDU Shirt 5.11 #62010

65 Tactical Men's L/S Class B Stryke PDU Shirt 5.11 72074

66 Tactical Men's S/S Class B Stryke PDU Shirt 5.11 71038
OUTERWEAR

67 BLK/48027BK WINTER JACKET 5.11 #48359

68 YLBK/B.DRY 733 REVERSIBLE RAIN JACKET W/O Hood Snaps#736 B Dry 733

69 48153 5.11 VALIANT 5:1 JACKET 5.11 #48153

70 BLK/210 ANCHOR UNIFORM BLOUSE COAT Anchor#210

71

BLK PACKABLE JACKET

5.11 Tactical #48035

72

BLKTACTICAL BIG HORN JACKET

5.11 Tactical #48026

73

BLK BIB APRONS NO POCKETS

Red Kap#1430BK

74 PRO SERIES SAFELTY VEST Flying Cross#71500

75 RESPONDER PARKA (EMS) 5.11 #48063

76 RW Hi-Vis B. Dry all purpose raincoat W/hood 5.11 #48099

77 JA820 Flying Cross Layertech soft-shell jacket Flying Cross # 54100A

78 JC433 Vedrtx Integrity Shell Vertx # VTX8800

79 RW Hi-Vis B. Dry all purpose raincoat W/hood Blauer # 26976

80 Blauer Fleece lined V-neck sweater Blauer # 225

81 Flying Cross ANSI Pro Series Safety Vest Flying Cross # 71500
HEADWEAR

82 182 STRETCH FITTED BB HAT Blauer 182

83 188 B COOL PERFORMANCE BB HAT Blauer 188

84 Flexfit V Flex Cotton twill BB cap Flexfit #

85 125X BLAUR WATCH CAP Blauer 125XCR

86

BLK/F38BK FELT STETSON

Stratton F38

87

1 piece leather strap for Stetson

Stratton ST-1P-BK

88

3 piece leather strap for Stetson

Stratton ST-3P-BK

89

HEADSTRAPS FOR STETSON

Stratton F38

90

BLK/D STRAP

Stratton

91

KNIT SKULL CAP BLK

Blauer 160

92

2 FLEX FIT BB HAT

FLEX FIT 2989

ACCESSORIES

93 LP880 BOSTON LEATHER GARRISON BELT Garrison #LP880
94 SAFARILAND BUCKLELESS DUTY BELT Safariland #99
95 /PF5001G GARRISON 1 %’ BLK BELT PF5001G




96

33005BK BLACK KNIT TIE

33005BK

97

ZA21801 Poly Knit 2.25" clip on tie - black

98

BRH/LH/SAF63608381 LEVEL Il ALS DUTY HOLSTER

Safariland #6360

99

SILVER POLISH NAMEPLATE

Reeves SILVER Polish

100

GP CB C511B Name Tag 3/8 x 2

Smith & Warren #C511B

101 J4 Gold Name Tag 2 x 3/8 Blackinton # J4
102 C600A Serving Since Pin Smith & Warren # C600A
103 16 Serving Since Bar Blackinton # J6

104

ACSO TIEBAR

105

RHD ACSO MLE

106

SCSO Tiebar - male

107

SCSO Tiebar - female

108

STREAMLIGHTFLASHLIGHT TACTICAL

Steamlight #88031

109

BLK TDU Belt 1.5" PLASTIC BUCKLE

5.11 Tactical #59551

110

STREAMLIGHT PRO-TAC FLASHLIGHT

STREAMLIGHT#69260

111

TLR 1 HL GUN MOUNT

STREAMLIGHT #69260

112

ACCUMOLD ELITE GUN POUCH BW

ACCUMOLD 22962

113

SAFARILAND OPEN TOP CUFF CASE

SAFARILAND #2344BW

114

Safarilaminate Double Magazone holder

Safariland # 77

115 HANDCUFFS CHAINLINK Peerless #700CNKL
116 MOURNING BAND Various
117 NP5 ACCUMLD ELITE BELT KEEPERS ACCUMOLD#22901

LEATHER GEAR

118

BW BRS/22246 ACCUMOLD ELITE EQUIPT. BELT

Accumold#22246

119

BW BRS/23822 ACCUMOLD COVERED CUFF CASE

Accumold #23822

120

Boston Leather cuff case

Boston Leather #5517

121

BW BRS/ACCUMOLD ELITE DOUBLE MAG.

Bianchi Accumold NP352

122

BW BRS/22191 ACCUMOLD ELITE GLOVE POUCH

Accumold #22191

123

NYLON BRS/22187 UNCLE MIKES BELT KEEPERS 4PK

Item#89080

124

BRH/LH/SAF63608381 LEVEL Il ALS DUTY HOLSTER

Safariland#63608381

125

SAFARILAND LEG HOLSTER (K-9)

Safariland#7305 RDS

126 ASP ROTATING SCABBARD 21’ ASP#6070
127 ASP 21’ BATON ASP#52412
128 26" EXSPANDABLE BATON ASP#52611
129 ASP Leverage Cap for Friction Batorns ASP #52921
130 BLK PLN ASP Sidebreak Scabbard for 26" Friction Baton ASP # 52632

131

UNCLE MIKE MACE POUCH

Uncle Mikes BP636

132

HEROS PRIDE NYLON TOURNIQUET HOLDER

Heros Pride 118-3

133 UNCLE MIKES NYLON DUTY BELT Uncle Mikes
134 1" BELT KEEPERS BOSTON LEATHER#5492
135 ACCUMOLD MACE CASE ACCUMOLD #22105

136

HG B667 6 point Star Badge Hi=Glo

Blackinton # B667 HG

137

M385 6 point Star Badge

Smith & Warren M385

138

6 point Star Badge with applied Panel - Pink

Blackinton # B667 Pink

139

FlexBadge Six point Star w/ applied panel

Blackinton # FLX667

140

High Profile Holster Insert Cup

Zarc International #K135

141

Galls Gear Leather Sam Browne Duty Belt - plain brass

GA150PA




142

Boston Leather fully lined 2.25 Duty Belt BRS PLN

Boston Leather # 6601

143 Galls 1" leather belt keepers - 4 pack PLN GA150PA

144 LawPro MK3 Mace Spray Holder #55271G

145 Boston Leather Mace Holder Boston Leather # 5538

146 LawPro Molded Douple Magazine Pouch 1825 B

147 Uncle Mike's Single Cuff Case 8878-17

148 Uncle Mike's Nylon Mark Ill Defense Spray Holder 8877-1?

149 Uncle Mike's 2" lined Duty Belt ?

150 Uncle Mike's nylon web belt keepers for 2 1/4" belt - 4 pack 8865-2?
FOOTWEAR

151 TACTICAL ATAC 8" STORM W/ZIPPER/WP 5.11 Tactical #12392

152 BATES OXFORD SHOE Bates #22233

153 BATES TACTICAL BOOTS BLK Bates#3180

154 5.11 WOMENS BOOTS BLK 5.11 #12406

155 WOMENS BATES BOOT Bates#2700
Misc Items

156 REG Silver Subdued Patch Various

157 Silver/BLK SGT Chevron Various

158 SIL/BLK SGT Chevron Various

159 Charcoal Gray Dept Patch Various

160 K9 Patch Charcoal Gray Various

161 Hat Patch for Corrections and Sheriff Various

162 Shoulder Patch for Corrections and Sheriff Various

163 EMS Logo Various

164 1°T SGT Stripes Large Various

165 1°T SGT Stripes Small Various

166 Sgt. Stripes Various

167 SIL/BLK-Hashmarks Charcoal Gray Various

168 White Cotton Pararade Gloves Finger Fashions 130XL

169 3/4" Namestrip monogram EMS Various

170 American Flag Patch Various

171 Embroidered Badge and Number Various

172 Embroidered Patch and Division Various

173 Heatseal Division on back of shirt Various

Discount

SECTION B (DISCOUNTED ITEMS)

Discount from Vendor Catalog (For all items not itemized in Section A

Mfg. Price list discount on Smith and Warren

Mfg. Price list discount on Blackington




Est. Usage Est. Usage Est Usage Saratoga
Sheriff Correctional County
Total Usage Brand/Item/Mfg being bid
114 114 Fechheimer #VR47680
61 17 90 168 Fechheimer #4720
40 40 Flying Cross #4728W
Tru Spec 1062
12 26 38 Tru-Spec 1096
45 30 75 5.11 74369
10 10 5.11 64386
24 24 5.11 Tctical 74273
20 20 Uncommon Threads #4020
5.11 #74433
Condor #38686
5.11 74434
20 20 Blauer #8560T
20 20 Blaure #8560WT
20 20 Blauer #8567T
20 20 Blauer #8567W
20 20 Blauer #8666
20 20 Blauer #8666W
20 20 5.11 74003
10 10 5.11 64359
90 90 5.11 74326
30 30 5.11 64306
5.11 74427
5.11 64402
15 15 5.11 73308
319 84 403 Fechheimer #55R8410
1 1 Blauer #8705
1 1 Blauer #8715
160 86 246 Fechheimer #05W84
234 234 5.11 71049
10 10 5.11 61165
11 38 49 Tru Spec #1227556
102 10 112 Blauer #8119
10 10 Blauer #8110
14 14 Blauer #8460
1 1 5.11 40016
25 25 Blauer #890011
10 10 Red Kap#5020BK
75 75 5.11 #71183 BLK
30 30 5.11 #72344 BLK
8 8 5.11 #62064
5.11 # 61158
25 25 5.11 #72054
15 15 5.11 # 62016
5.11 #71322
20 20 Fech #105wW8410




20 20 Fech #155R8426
20 20 Vertex # VTX4030P
20 20 Vertx #VTX4010P
50 50 Vertx # VTX4000P
50 50 Vertx #VTX4020P
10 10 Blauer #8362W
10 10 Blauer #8361W
Blauer #8676
Blauer #8671
Blauer #8676W
Blauer #8671W
Blauer #8436
Blauer #8446
Blauer #8446W
Blauer #8436W
LAWPRO #SW1824
20 20 5.11 61018
30 30 5.11 #62010
60 60 5.11 72074
30 30 5.11 71038
29 29 5.11 #48359
25 20 45 B Dry 733
1 1 5.11 #48153
20 20 Anchor#210
68 68 5.11 Tactical #48035
43 43 5.11 Tactical #48026
24 24 Red Kap#1430BK
25 25 Flying Cross#71500
5.11 #48063
5 5 5.11 #48099
30 30 Flying Cross # 54100A
30 30 Vertx # VT X8800
30 30 5.11 #48125
30 30 Blauer # 225
30 30 Flying Cross # 71500
1 1 Blauer 182
1 1 Blauer 188
30 30 Flexfit #
12 12 Blauer 125XCR
18 30 48 Stratton F38
30 30 Stratton ST-1P-BK
5 5 Stratton ST-3P-BK
37 37 Stratton F38
1 1 Stratton #5733
100 20 120 Blauer 160
FLEX FIT 2989
27 27 Garrison #L.P880
1 1 Safariland #99
1 1 PF5001G




47 47 33005BK
60 60 ZA21801 Poly Knit
16 16 Safariland #6360
17 26 43 Reeves SILVER Polish
30 30 Smith & Warren NP 102
30 30 Blackinton # J4
30 30 Smith & Warren # C600A
30 30 Blackinton # J6
1 1 ACSO TIEBAR
28
28 TC-826/4049 RHD-ACSO
25 25 TC-826/4049 GLD-NYS-MALE
8 8
TC-826/4049 GLD-NYS-FEM
275 275 Steamlight #88031
92 92 5.11 Tactical #59551
50 50 STREAMLIGHT#69260
19
19 STREAMLIGHT #69260
15 15 ACCUMOLD 22962
25 25 Safariland #2344BW
45 45 Safariland #77
30 30 Peerless #700CNKL
1 1
ACCUMOLD#22901
15 15 Accumold#22246
11 11 Accumold #23822
30 30 Boston Leather #5517
17 17 Bianchi Accumold NP352
1 1 Accumold #22191
1 17 18 I1tem#89080
16 16 Safariland #63608381
1 1 Safariland#7305 RDS
13 13 ASP#6070
1 1 ASP#52412
12 12 ASP#52611
12 12 ASP #52921
30 30 ASP # 52632
1 1 Uncle Mikes BP636
1 1 Heros Pride 118-3
1 1 Uncle Mikes
BOSTON LEATHER#5492
ACCUMOLD #22105
20 20 Blackinton # B667 HG
20 20 Smith & Warren M385
10 10 Blackinton # B667 Pink
25 25 Blackinton # FLX667
25 25 Zarc International #K135
30 30 GAI150PA




30 30 Boston Leather # 6601
30 30 GA150PA
30 30 #55271G
30 30 Boston Leather #5538
20 20 1825 B
5 5 8878-1
5 5 Uncle Mikes
5 5 Uncle Mikes
5 5 8865-2
14 12 26 5.11 Tactical #12392
10 10 Bates #22233
10 10 Bates#3180
5 5 5.11 #12406
20 20 Bates#2700
1 1
30 30
1 1
1 1
1 1
1 1
1 1
312 312
1 1
1 1
1 1
1 1
12 12 Finger Fashions 130XL
121 121
404 404
1 1
1 1
1 1




GALLS

WICKEDSMART

Price Each Total Brand/Item/Mfg being bid Price Each

$ 12358 | $ 14,088.12 | Blauer 8565T $ 109.00
$ 85.00 [ $ 14,280.00 | Blauer 8560T $ 97.00
$ 85.00 % 3,400.00 | Blauer 8560WT $ 97.00
$ 49.00 | $ - | First Tactical 114011 $ 57.00
$ 49.00 | $ 1,862.00 | First Tactical 124011 $ 57.00
$ 69.00 | $ 5,175.00 | First Tactical 114011 $ 57.00
$ 69.00 [ $ 690.00 | First Tactical 124011 $ 57.00
$ 52.00 [ $ 1,248.00 | Rothco 3761 $ 33.00
$ 29.88 [ $ 597.60 | Edwards Garments 2001 $ 20.00
$ 86.78 [ $ - No bid $ -
$ 45.00 | $ - No bid $ -
$ 80.80 [ $ - No bid $ -
$ 12649 $ 2,529.80 | Blauer #8560T $ 97.00
$ 126.49 | $ 2,529.80 | Blauer 856 WT $ 97.00
$ 14399 $ 2,879.80 | Blauer 8567T $ 109.00
$ 98.50 | $ 1,970.00 | Blauer 8567WT $ 109.00
$ 99.99 | $ 1,999.80 | Blauer #8666 $ 85.00
$ 99.99 [ $ 1,999.80 | Blauer #8666W $ 85.00
$ 64.96 | $ 1,299.20 | First Tactical 114012 $ 49.00
$ 64.96 [ $ 649.60 | First Tactical 124012 $ 49.00
$ 69.53 | $ 6,257.70 | First Tactical 114011 $ 57.00
$ 69.53 | $ 2,085.90 | First Tactical 124011 $ 57.00
$ 88.18 [ $ - No bid $ -
$ 86.78 | $ - No bid $ -
$ 52,65 (% 789.75 | First Tactical 115000 $ 49.00

$ _

$ 85.00 % 34,255.00 | Blaur 8446 $ 77.00
$ 79.00 [ $ 79.00 | Blauer #8705 $ 58.00
$ 70.00 [ $ 70.00 | Blauer #8715 $ 49.00
$ 95.00 | $ 23,370.00 | Blauer #8436 $ 87.00
$ 56.55 [ $ 13,232.70 | First Tactical 112509 $ 37.00
$ 54.44 | $ 544.40 | First Tactical 122509 $ 37.00
$ 4495 | $ 2,202.55 | Cornerstone CS412 $ 28.00
$ 2250 (% 2,520.00 | Blauer #8119 $ 14.75
$ 4355|$% 435.50 | Blauer #8110X $ 30.00
$ 95.00 | $ 1,330.00 | Blauer #8460 $ 72.00
$ 4222 1% 42.22 | First Tactical 112501 $ 17.25
$ 89.17 | % 2,229.25 No bid $ -
$ 19.00 | $ 190.00 | Edwards Garments 1302 $ 13.25
$ 55.00 [ $ 4,125.00 | First Tactical 112001 $ 55.00
$ 75.00 % 2,250.00 | First Tactical 111011 $ 59.00
$ 75.00 [ $ 600.00 | First Tactical 121011 $ 59.00
$ 55.00 [ $ - | First Tactical 122001 $ 55.00
$ 65.00 | $ 1,625.00 | First Tactical 111008 $ 57.00
$ 80.45(% 1,206.75 | First Tactical 121008 $ 57.00
$ 67.80 [ $ - No bid $ -
$ 109.07 | $ 2,181.40 | Blauer 8436W $ 87.00




$ 99.15| % 1,983.00 | Blauer 8446\W $ 77.00
$ 55.00 | $ 1,100.00 | First Tactical 121503 $ 41.00
$ 50.00 [ $ 1,000.00 | First Tactical 122509 $ 37.00
$ 50.00 [ $ 2,500.00 | First Tactical 112509 $ 37.00
$ 55.00 | $ 2,750.00 | First Tactical 111503 $ 41.00
$ 75.00 [ $ 750.00 | Blauer #8362W $ 52.00
$ 85.00 [ $ 850.00 | Blauer #8361W $ 58.00
$ 8499 (% - | Blauer #8676 $ 63.00
$ 8499 9% - Blauer #8671 $ 67.00
$ 8499 9% - | Blauer #8676W $ 63.00
$ 89.99 % - | Blauer #8671W $ 67.00
$ 93.99 (% - | Blauer #8436 $ 87.00
$ 10499 | $ - | Blauer #8446 $ 77.00
$ 104.00 | $ - | Blauer #8446W $ 77.00
$ 11499 $ - | Blauer #8436W $ 87.00
$ 39.00($ - | Blauer # 8133 $ 63.00
$ 96.75 | $ 1,935.00 | First Tactical 122011 $ 55.00
$ 101.00 | $ 3,030.00 | First Tactical #121011 $ 59.00
$ 102.73 | $ 6,163.80 | First Tactical 111011 $ 59.00
$ 098.15| $ 2,944.50 | First Tactical #112001 $ 55.00
$ B
$ 25411 ($ 7,369.19 | First Tactical 118502 $ 315.00
$ 209.00 [ $ 9,405.00 | Blauer #26990 $ 135.00
$ 29280 | $ 292.80 | First Tactical 118502 $ 315.00
$ 32167 ($ 6,433.40 | Anchor#210BLC $ 205.00
$ 45.00 | $ 3,060.00 | First Tactical 118509 $ 48.00
$ 99.00 | $ 4,257.00 | First Tactical 118501 $ 110.00
$ 12.00 | $ 288.00 | Red Kap#1430BK $ 7.25
$ 54451 % 1,361.25 | Blauer #339 $ 42.00
$ 27591 $ - No bid $ -
$ 127451 % 637.25 | Blauer #29676-1/123 $ 149.00
$ 13584 $ 4,075.20 | First Tactical 118503 $ 110.00
$ 251.13($ 7,533.90 | First Tactical 118520 $ 208.00
$ 149.00 | $ 4,470.00 | Blauer # 26976 $ 135.00
$ 183.00 | $ 5,490.00 | Blauer # 225 $ 105.00
$ 5733 1% 1,719.90 | Blauer #339 $ 42.00
$ -
$ _
$ 22.00 | $ 22.00 | Blauer 182 $ 12.00
$ 22009 22.00 | Blauer 188 $ 11.00
$ 2299 1% 689.70 | Flexfit #6277 $ 10.00
$ 4500 | % 540.00 | Blauer 125XCR $ 35.00
$ 99.00 | $ 4,752.00 | Stratton F38 $ 112.00
$ 11.00 | $ 330.00 | Stratton ST-1P-BK $ 9.00
$ 13.00 | $ 65.00 | Stratton ST-3P-BK $ 11.00
$ 99.00 % 3,663.00 No bid $ -
$ 500|$% 5.00 No bid $ -
$ 2650 (% 3,180.00 | Blauer 160 $ 23.50
$ 19.00 1 $ - No bid $ -
$ -
$ 19851 % 535.95 | Boston Leather 6605-1 $ 19.50
$ 40.00 | $ 40.00 | Safariland #99 $ 38.00
$ 25.00 % 25.00 | Boston Leather 6605-1 $ 19.50




$ 10.00 | $ 470.00 | Samuel Broome 33005 $ 11.00
$ 10.00 | $ 600.00 | Samuel Broome 33005 $ 11.00
$ 165.00 [ $ 2,640.00 | Safariland #6360 $ 146.00
$ 17.00 | $ 731.00 | Smith & Warren NP 102 $ 12.75
$ 17.00 [ $ 510.00 | Smith & Warren NP 102 $ 12.75
$ 15.00 (| $ 450.00 | Smith & Warren NP 102 $ 12.75
$ 29.00 | $ 870.00 | Smith & Warren NP 105 $ 12.75
$ 15.00 [ $ 450.00 | Smith & Warren NP 105 $ 12.75
$ 1550 | $ 15.50 | Smith & Warren C511T $ 28.00
$ 1550 $ 434.00 | Smith & Warren C511T $ 28.00
$ 15.50( $ 387.50 Smith &Warren C511T $ 28.00
$ 15501 % 124.00 | Smith & Warren C511T $ 28.00
$ 4900 (% 13,475.00 | Steamlight #88031 $ 61.00
$ 17951 % 1,651.40 | First Tactical 143001 $ 18.00
$ 109.00 [ $ 5,450.00 | Steamlight #88031 $ 61.00
$ 135.00 [ $ 2,565.00 | STREAMLIGHT #69260 $ 177.00
$ 1150 | $ 172.50 | Bianchi 7928/22962 $ 22.50
$ 17.00 | $ 425.00 | Bianchi 7934/22966 $ 25.75
$ 31.00% 1,395.00 | Bianchi 7902 $ 39.50
$ 29.00 | $ 870.00 | Peerless #700C $ 29.50
$ 500|$ 5.00 | Various $ 2.25
$ 15.00 | $ - | Bianchi 7906 $ 14.00
$ -
3 -

$ 59.00 % 885.00 | Bianchi 7960 $ 65.00
$ 31.00( % 341.00 | Bianchi 7900/23822 $ 30.00
$ 39.00 | $ 1,170.00 | Boston Leather #5517 $ 31.25
$ 37501 % 637.50 | Bianchi 7902 $ 39.50
$ 25.00 [ $ 25.00 | Bianchi 7915 $ 24.25
$ 15.00 | $ 270.00 | Bianchi 7406 $ 13.50
$ 165.00 | $ 2,640.00 | Safariland #360 w/light $ 160.00
$ 199.00 | $ 199.00 | Safariland#7305 RDS $ 249.00
$ 48.00 | $ 624.00 | ASP 52433 $ 59.00
$ 135.00 | $ 135.00 | ASP52400 $ 100.00
$ 139.00 | $ 1,668.00 | ASP 52600 $ 108.00
$ 17.00 | $ 204.00 | ASP52921 $ 21.00
$ 5400 | $ 1,620.00 | ASP # 52632 $ 66.00
$ 17.00 | $ 17.00 | Bianchi 7307 $ 21.75
$ 39.00( % 39.00 No bid $ -

$ 20.00 (% 20.00 | Bianchi 7200 $ 48.75
$ 7501 % - BOSTON LEATHER#5492-3 $ 6.00
$ 29.00 [ $ - | Bianchi 7907 $ 29.50
$ 99.00 [ $ 1,980.00 | Smith & Warren M385 $ 120.00
$ 89.50 | $ 1,790.00 | Smith & Warren M385 $ 90.00
$ 65.00 | $ 650.00 | Smith & Warren M385 Pink $ 90.00
$ 25.001 % 625.00 No bid $ -

$ 470($ 117.50 No bid $ -

$ 38.00( % 1,140.00 | Boston Leather 6601-1 $ 51.00




$ 32.001(% 960.00 | Boston Leather # 6601 $ 51.00
$ 15.00 | $ 450.00 | Bianchi 7906 $ 14.00
$ 19.00 | $ 570.00 | Bianchi 7307 $ 21.75
$ 21.00($ 630.00 | Boston Leather #5538 $ 21.00
$ 18.00 | $ 360.00 | Bianchi 7302 $ 32.00
$ 22.00 (% 110.00 | Bianchi 7300 $ 26.50
$ 17.00 | $ 85.00 | Bianch 7307 $ 21.75
$ 32.001(% 160.00 | Bianchi 7200 $ 48.75
$ 9.99|$% 49.95 | Bianchi 7406 $ 13.50
$ -
$ -
$ 13087 $ 3,402.62 | First Tactical $ 130.00
$ 77.00$ 770.00 | Rothco 5055 $ 50.00
$ 12495 $ 1,249.50 | Rocky 2165 $ 110.00
$ 13651 ($ 682.55 | Rocky 4167 $ 105.00
$ 99.00 2 1,980.00 | Rocky 4165 $ 110.00
$ B
$ 500 (% 5.00 | Various $ 5.00
$ 4751% 142.50 | Various $ 5.00
$ 310 $ 3.10 | Various $ 5.00
$ 8.40(% 8.40 | Various $ 5.00
$ 599 (% 5.99 | Various $ 5.00
$ 4001]$% 4.00 | Various $ 5.00
$ 500(% 5.00 | Various $ 5.00
$ 10.00 | $ 3,120.00 | Various $ 8.00
$ 259 (% 2.59 | Various $ 5.00
$ 259 (% 2.59 | Various $ 5.00
$ 3.00|$% 3.00 | Various $ 5.00
$ 3.00|$% 3.00 | Various $ 5.00
$ 4251% 51.00 | Hatch WG1000S $ 10.00
$ 9.00|$% 1,089.00 | Various $ 5.00
$ 225|% 909.00 | Various $ 2.50
$ 2399 [ $ 23.99 | Various $ 10.00
$ 2399 (% 23.99 | Various $ 10.00
$ 4409 4.40 | Various $ 10.00
$ 321,443.55
15% 10%
20% 15%

20%




Total

12,426.00

16,296.00

3,880.00

2,166.00

4,275.00

570.00

792.00

400.00

1,940.00

1,940.00

2,180.00

2,180.00

1,700.00

1,700.00

980.00

490.00

5,130.00

1,710.00

735.00

31,031.00

58.00

49.00

21,402.00

8,658.00

370.00

1,372.00

1,652.00

300.00

1,008.00

17.25

132.50

4,125.00

1,770.00

472.00

1,425.00

855.00

AR |A|A AR |R|R AR |R| R |R|R|A BB | AR |R AR ||| |R AR | |PR|R|R|A R | |PR || |B || |R|R|R| B || P

1,740.00




1,540.00

820.00

740.00

1,850.00

2,050.00

520.00

580.00

1,100.00

1,770.00

3,540.00

1,650.00

9,135.00

6,075.00

315.00

4,100.00

3,264.00

4,730.00

174.00

1,050.00

745.00

3,300.00

6,240.00

4,050.00

3,150.00

1,260.00

12.00

11.00

300.00

420.00

5,376.00

270.00

55.00

2,820.00

526.50

38.00

AR AR AR |PR|R PR |R|R|R|R PR |R|R|R|R|R|R|R|R|R|RA|R|R|R|R|RR|R|R|R|R PR R |R|R|R AR R |R|R BB A

19.50




517.00

660.00

2,336.00

548.25

382.50

382.50

382.50

382.50

28.00

AR |AR|R AR | R |R|R|P

784.00

©

700.00

©

224.00

16,775.00

1,656.00

3,050.00

| Bl s

3,363.00

337.50

643.75

1,777.50

885.00

2.25

975.00

330.00

937.50

671.50

24.25

243.00

2,560.00

249.00

767.00

100.00

1,296.00

252.00

1,980.00

21.75

48.75

2,400.00

1,800.00

900.00

AN AR|R|R|R PR |R|R PRSP R |R|R PR |R|R|R|R|R AR PR B | AP

1,530.00




1,530.00

420.00

652.50

630.00

640.00

132.50

108.75

243.75

67.50

3,380.00

500.00

1,100.00

525.00

2,200.00

5.00

150.00

5.00

5.00

5.00

5.00

5.00

2,496.00

5.00

5.00

5.00

5.00

120.00

605.00

1,010.00

10.00

10.00

AN AR PR |R|R|R|R|R PR R |R|R AR AR R |R|R PR |ARP|R|R|R PR | R |R|R P

10.00

281,016.75




