RFB-2025-029Projected cost of 3-year contract

Moore Fire Equipment

Johnson Controls

6

Fire Extinguishers QTY: Service EXT QTY Year/Recharge Ext qty Hydro Ext QTY: Service QTY 6 Year Ext qty Hydro Ext
2.5LB ABC 15 4.50 67.50 15 16.50 247.50 15 16.50 247.50 15 7.00 105.00 15 45.00 675.00 15 50.00 750.00
5LB ABC 79 4.50 355.50 79 17.50 1,382.50 79 17.50 1,382.50 79 7.00 553.00 79 55.00 4,345.00 79 60.00 4,740.00
10 LB ABC 476 4.50 2,142.00 476 25.50 | $12,138.00 476 17.50 8,330.00 476 7.00 3,332.00 476 60.00 [ $28,560.00 476 65.00 | $30,940.00
20 LB ABC 101 4.50 454.50 101 32.50 3,282.50 101 17.50 1,767.50 101 7.00 707.00 101 85.00 8,585.00 101 95.00 9,595.00
5LB CO2 9 4.50 40.50 9 0.00 0.00 9 0.00 0.00] 9 7.00 63.00 9 55.00 495.00 9 75.00 675.00
10 LB CO2 7 4.50 31.50 7 0.00 0.00 7 0.00 0.00| 7 7.00 49.00 7 65.00 455.00 7 85.00 595.00
15 LB CO2 4 4.50 18.00 4 0.00 0.00 4 0.00 0.00) 4 7.00 28.00 4 70.00 280.00 4 90.00 360.00
20 LB CO2 15 4.50 67.50 15 24.50 367.50 15 20.00 300.00 15 7.00 105.00 15 75.00 1,125.00 15 95.00 1,425.00
6 L K Class 7 4.50 31.50 7 45.00 315.00 7 25.00 175.00 7 7.00 49.00 7 | $200.00 1,400.00 7 | $225.00 1,575.00
2.5 GAL H20 29 4.50 130.50 29 21.50 623.50 29 20.00 580.00 29 7.00 203.00 29 65.00 1,885.00 29 70.00 2,030.00
1.75 GAL Water Mist 4 4.50 18.00 4 24.50 98.00 4 15.00 60.00 4 7.00 28.00 4 65.00 260.00 4 70.00 280.00
Total of Extended Amount 746 $3,357.00 $18,454.50 $12,842.50 746 $ 5,222.00 $48,065.00 $52,965.00
Yearly Service $ 3,357.00 Yearly Service $ 5,222.00
Total of 6 Year and Hydro $  31,297.00 Total of 6 Year and Hydro $101,030.00
Yearly Service 3 years $10,071.00 Yearly Service 3 years $15,666.00
Total estimated Cost 3 yr Total estimated Cost 3 yr
Fire Extinguishers $103,962.00 JFire Extinguishers $318,756.00
Total estimated Cost 3 yr Total estimated Cost 3 yr
Suppression Systems Suppression Systems
Awarded $ 7,200.00 Awarded $ 8,253.84

Semi Annual Semi
Fire Suppression Systems Annual Cost 3 Yr Total |Fire Suppression Systems |Annual Annual Cost| 3 Yr Total
FM200 Hall of Records No Bid FM200 Hall of Records $ 393.04[$ 786.08 [$ 2,358.24
Kitchen Knight Shaker Pl $ 300.00 $600.00 [ $  1,800.00 Kitchen Knight Shaker PI $ 393.04|$ 786.08[$ 2358.24
Sapphire Correctional No Bid No Bid Sapphire Correctional $ 393.04[$ 786.08 [$ 2,358.24
Ansul R102 Correctional $ 300.00 $600.00 [$  1,800.00 Ansul R102 Correctional $ 393.04($ 786.08 9% 2358.24
FM200 Correctional No Bid No Bid |FM200 Correctional $ 393.04|$ 786.08|% 2,358.24
Pemall B Public Works $ 300.00[$ 600.00|% 1,800.00 Pemall B Public Works $ 393.04|% 786.08 % 2358.24
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Pyro-Chem Public Works

$ 300.00

$ 600.00

$

1,800.00

Pyro-Chem Public Works

$

393.04

$

786.08

$ 2,358.24

Greenheck Sheriff

$ 300.00

$ 600.00

$

1,800.00

Greenheck Sheriff

$

196.52

$

393.04

$ 1,179.12
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